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Team D3 is positioning its CAD LIVE Training Platform as the standard for continuous professional 

development. 
 
Springfield, MO – January 12, 2023 – Team D3 is expanding its CAD LIVE training platform to become a standard for 
providing ongoing education to a variety of industries, including Manufacturing, AECO, and Plant & Process 
professionals, further solidifying their role in each respective industry.  
 
Team D3, a commonly owned coalition of brands consisting of D3 Technologies, MG-AECO Technology Partners, and 
ECAD Inc, will be expanding its CAD LIVE Training platform to offer a wider variety of Training Plans and position the 
platform as the standard for continuous professional development. After years of heavily investing in expanding their 
talents, capabilities, and expertise through various strategic partnerships and acquisitions, Team D3 represents a 
convergence of knowledge bridging the gaps between the Manufacturing, AECO, and Plant & Process industries. The 
CAD LIVE Training platform provides professional development opportunities for all of these industries. Team D3’s 
customers have found great success with Training Plans that offer a streamlined, cost-effective solution to train new 
hires and provide ongoing professional development.  
 
The Training Plans that Team D3 provides are focused on training professionals in the AECO and Manufacturing 
industries, but will soon include a broader range of offerings. The CAD LIVE training platform currently enables Team D3 
to deliver over 150 individual Autodesk courses covering a large array of Autodesk products and software to students 
nationwide. The platform leverages cloud-based technology to simulate a traditional classroom in a remote and digital 
environment. Students have the ability to interact with a geographically diverse class, participate in live lectures and 
demonstrations with a certified Team D3 instructor, and practice hands-on with their own remote computer. All 
software and class files are provided through the platform.  
 
“Autodesk assessed multiple delivery platforms for training their educational partners and chose Team D3’s CAD Live 
platform as their standard,” says Team D3 CEO and Founder, Kevin Schlack.  
“CAD LIVE is all about connection - connecting our passionate industry-professional instructors, students who are eager 
to learn new skills, and the technology that makes it all possible,” remarks Team D3’s Manager of Education Programs, 
Ryan Johnson. “With our growing catalog of courses, Team D3 has taught over 4,000 students nationwide just in the last 
year. Many of these are part of our Evolve training plan, which provides subscription-based live training with unlimited 
access to all included courses. With CAD LIVE, Team D3 is proud to help our clients build the world around us!”  
 
As a result of this coalition, Team D3 expects their CAD LIVE training platform to become a standard for providing 
ongoing education to a variety of industries, including Manufacturing, AECO, and Plant & Process professionals, further 
solidifying their role in each respective industry. 
 
About D3 - D3 Technologies is an Autodesk Platinum-level partner dedicated to Autodesk manufacturing solutions in 
North America, including being a valued integrator of Autodesk manufacturing and plant solutions. From the initial 
concept to the final product - D3’s solutions will transform your manufacturing and engineering operations by improving 
workflows, aligning you with the right technologies, and providing educational pathways and support. D3 has been a 
trusted partner to US manufacturers since 1999, and we will continue to partner with those that demand the best. See a 
full list of our solutions and services on D3's website. www.d3tech.net 

https://www.d3tech.net/learning/events/?paid=true
https://www.mg-aec.com/
https://ecadinc.com/
https://www.d3tech.net/learning/hub/1708/?hsCtaTracking=2411bc83-b1d2-4c1f-bcb1-b04ad1cc6a78%7C29c4127b-a463-4ca3-a2ac-050125355db7
https://www.d3tech.net/learning/#plans
https://www.d3tech.net/learning/events/?paid=true
http://www.d3tech.net/
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About MG - MG AECO Technology Partners is a premier provider of Architecture, Engineering, Construction, and Owner 
(AECO) technologies and services. MG combines broad expertise in AECO industry professional best practices and the 
technology solutions that help their clients create world-class projects. MG believes that a well-informed environment 
leads to the development of intelligent, sustainable, and effective projects for tomorrow's world. www.mg-aec.com 
 
About ECAD - Offering a variety of premium products, expert training and services, and superior support, ECAD is one of 
the nation’s premier CAD software and services providers. As an Autodesk Platinum Partner, ECAD is a leader in the 
Plant & Process Industries, known for its exceptional expertise in supporting their clients who participate in the Oil and 
Gas markets. With a variety of the industry's best products, expert consulting services, professionally certified training, 
and superior support, our mission has been to deliver unmatched value and customer satisfaction through a unique 
approach that integrates hardware, software, and professional services. www.ecadinc.com 
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